
Scottsdale Planning and Development Services
One Stop Shop 
7447 E Indian School Road, Suite 105 
480-312-2500

Quality 
Submittal 
Guidelines 

Counter Plan for 
Minor Single Family 

Additions and 
Remodels

Effective 7/1/2010 - all property owners applying for a permit for new construction will be required to

submit a properly completed Owner Builder Form before a building permit will be issued.  

Projects that may qualify for over-the-counter plan 
review: 
• Remodels or additions less than 1000 SF – no second

floor additions or basements.
• Patio additions and enclosures.
• Carports enclosures into garages or livable space.
• Garage conversions to livable space.
• Non-habitable accessory buildings less than 1000 SF.
• Solar panels that are in compliance with City of

Scottsdale placement guidelines.

During busy waiting periods, only one plan per customer will be honored. 

All properties zoned Environmentally Sensitive Lands (ESL) 
  must be submitted for review.    

http://www.scottsdaleaz.gov/Assets/Public+Website/bldgresources/Owner+Builder+Statement.pdf


Counter Plan Reviews /Permits & 
Minimum Permits Requirements 

1) PLEASE NOTE THE FOLLOWING REQUIREMENTS FOR OBTAINING MINOR SFR REMODEL,
ADDITIONS OR MINIMUM PERMITS OVER THE COUNTER:

a) A Permit Application must be completed and will not be accepted until all “REQUIRED” items are fully
entered.

b) In most cases permits should only be signed for by property owners or licensed Contractors.  All other
persons involved with the project ( including but not limited to relatives, architects, designers or
construction managers ) can have a statement signed by the property owner naming who has
permission to sign and receive documents on the Owner’s behalf to obtain plan reviews and building
permits from the City of Scottsdale.

c) Plan review fees must be paid for the same day the plans are reviewed or submitted for review.  This is
true whether permits are issued that day or not.

d) Per Arizona State statute 32-1121, on residential single family permits not listing a licensed contractor,
an owner occupied single family residence property owner can do the work themselves or act as their
own general contractor and hire subcontractors to do the work. Questions regarding this State statute
should be directed to the Registrar of Contractors: 1-877-692-9762 or visit www.azroc.gov.  When
choosing to do the work themselves or to act as their own general contractor, the property owner or
their representative (see item b) above ) must sign the “Owner-Builder Declaration form” required by
the Tax Audit Division of the City of Scottsdale.  For detailed information about this form call 480-312-
2400 or visit www.scottsdaleaz.gov/taxes .

Planning and Development Services
7447 E. Indian School Road, Suite 100, Scottsdale, AZ  85251  www.ScottsdaleAZ.gov 

http://www.azroc.gov/�
http://www.scottsdaleaz.gov/taxes�


Note: Log in to Online Services and Submit an Online Application for faster service. No Account? Registration is Easy. 

APP-PERMIT-SFR Page 1 Revision Date:  07/11/2017 KPerikly 

Single Family Residential 
Application for Permitting 
Excludes Demo, Fire, Pools, & Backflow Preventer

Office Use Only Staff: Date: Permit # or 
Plan Check #: 

*PROJECT ADDRESS: *Lot #:

*Subdivision:

*Zoning District: *Parcel Number:

*Quarter Section: *Flood Zone:

*Lot Area: ___________________________________ *NAOS Sq. Footage: ________________________________

*PROJECT NAME:   _________________________________________________________________________ 

*Associated Plan/Case Numbers __________________   _________________  ________________  (If Applicable)

The following Construction Document Applications must be in separate packages by Section and each section 
must be separated by the review discipline. See the individual sections herein for each of the application 
submittal content requirements: 

*PERMIT/PLAN TYPE:
   (Check all that apply)  Revision to Approved Plan?   Yes  No    

Green Building Program?  Yes   No       Green Building Case # _______________ 

  SINGLE FAMILY RESIDENTIAL: 
 New SFR       Remodel     Addition   New SFR Standard    Guest House 

 New Fence/Wall  Retaining Wall       Accessory Structure 

   MINIMUM:  Mechanical    Plumbing    Electrical  Building    Combo 

*Scope of work: ________________________________________________________________________________   _

*PROJECT SQUARE FOOTAGES*

  New:                   Area under roof Occupied A/C___________ sq.ft. Non Occupied A/C  _____________ sq.ft. 

       Fence: LF _____________  Retaining Wall: LF ________________ 

  Remodel:     Area under roof Occupied A/C___________ sq.ft. Non Occupied A/C   _____________ sq.ft. 

  Addition:     Area under roof Occupied A/C___________ sq.ft. Non Occupied A/C   _____________ sq.ft. 

  Guest House:    Area under roof Occupied A/C___________ sq.ft. Non Occupied A/C   _____________ sq.ft. 
  

*Note: When the square footage within exterior enclosing walls exceeds 12,000 SF, big box requirements are 
applicable.

*Required
Planning and Development Services 

7447 East Indian School Road Suite 105, Scottsdale, Arizona  85251  Phone: 480-312-7000  Fax: 480-312-7088 
City of Scottsdale’s Website: www.scottsdaleaz.gov 

https://eservices.scottsdaleaz.gov/eservices/Registration/Login.aspx?ReturnUrl=%2feServices%2fMembers%2fPlanning%2fPlanReview%2fApplicationStep1.aspx


Note: Log in to Online Services and Submit an Online Application for faster service. No Account? Registration is Easy. 

APP-PERMIT-SFR Page 2 Revision Date:  07/11/2017 KPerikly 

Single Family Residential 
Application for Permitting 
Excludes Demo, Fire, Pools, & Backflow Preventer 

*Property Owner:

*Address:

*City__________________ *State______ *Zip________

*Phone: Fax: 

*Email:

Contractor:  

Address:  

City__________________ State______ Zip__________ 

Phone:    Fax:  

Email:  

ROC#  ___________       COS Tax License#___________  

Architect:  

Company:  

Address:  

City _________________ State_____ Zip _________ 

Phone:    Fax:  

Email: 

Civil Engineer:  

Company:  

Address:  

City____________________ State______ Zip_________ 

Phone:    Fax:  

Email:  

The property owner shall designate an agent as the applicant for the project 

PLANS & PERMITS WILL ONLY BE RELEASED TO THE PERSON(S) LISTED AS THE APPLICANT CONTACT BELOW. ANY 
PERSONS NOT LISTED AS CONTACT WILL REQUIRE AUTHORIZATION LETTER FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED. 

*Applicant Contact:  Company: 

*E-mail:  Phone:   Fax:  

Address:     City_____________________ State______ Zip_________  

*Others authorized to pick up plans & permits: ______________________________________________________

I (the undersigned) understand and agree that the issuance of the permit for which I am applying does not relieve me of the responsibility 
that this work will be done in conformity with the laws of the City of Scottsdale, Maricopa County and the State of Arizona. I further agree 
that the Scottsdale Inspections Division has the authority to enforce adopted building codes and appropriate State, County and City laws 
and regulations not indicated on the construction documents. I acknowledge that this application will expire 180 days after the last plan 
submittal. 

 OR 
*Owner Signature Date *Applicant Signature Date 

*Required

Planning and Development Services 
7447 East Indian School Road Suite 105, Scottsdale, Arizona  85251  | www.ScottsdaleAZ.gov

https://eservices.scottsdaleaz.gov/eservices/Registration/Login.aspx?ReturnUrl=%2feServices%2fMembers%2fPlanning%2fPlanReview%2fApplicationStep1.aspx


Note: Log in to Online Services and Submit an Online Application for faster service. No Account? Registration is Easy. 

APP-PERMIT-SFR Page 3 Revision Date:  07/11/2017 KPerikly 

Single Family Residential 
Application for Permitting 
Arizona Revised Statutes Notice 

§9-834. Prohibited acts by municipalities and employees; enforcement; notice

A. A municipality shall not base a licensing decision in whole or in part on a licensing requirement or
condition that is not specifically authorized by statute, rule, ordinance or code. A general grant of
authority does not constitute a basis for imposing a licensing requirement or condition unless the
authority specifically authorizes the requirement or condition.

B. Unless specifically authorized, a municipality shall avoid duplication of other laws that do not enhance
regulatory clarity and shall avoid dual permitting to the maximum extent practicable.

C. This section does not prohibit municipal flexibility to issue licenses or adopt ordinances or codes.

D. A municipality shall not request or initiate discussions with a person about waiving that person’s rights.

E. This section may be enforced in a private civil action and relief may be awarded against a municipality.
The court may award reasonable attorney fees, damages, and all fees associated with the license
application to a party that prevails in an action against a municipality for a violation of this section.

F. A municipal employee may not intentionally or knowingly violate this section. A violation of this section is
cause for disciplinary action or dismissal pursuant to the municipality’s adopted personnel policy.

G. This section does not abrogate the immunity provided by section 12-820.01 or 12-820.02.

Planning and Development Services 
7447 East Indian School Road Suite 105, Scottsdale, Arizona  85251  |  www.ScottsdaleAZ.gov 

https://eservices.scottsdaleaz.gov/eservices/Registration/Login.aspx?ReturnUrl=%2feServices%2fMembers%2fPlanning%2fPlanReview%2fApplicationStep1.aspx


Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels      1 

General Information 
Important:  Counter Review cannot require any planning or civil issues.  If a civil issue or planning is 
required, you must complete a full review. 

Use a Single family Counter Plan Submittal Procedure for the following: 

A. Garage and Carport Conversions and Enclosures
B. Patio Covers and Patio Cover Enclosures
C. Detached Storage Sheds
D. Remodels with little or no structural Revisions to the Existing Residence.
E. New Patio covers and ramadas.

Plan Submittal Requirements 
Submit two (2) complete sets of plans to include the following: 

a. Site plan on each set plus 1 additional (3 total).
b. Dimensioned foundation plan showing new and existing structural supports and/or posts.
c. Dimensioned floor plan
d. Roof framing plan.  If engineered trusses are used, submit the manufacturer’s sealed

calculations.
e. Minimum of two (2) elevations
f. Material specifications and Fasteners Schedule.
g. Construction details keyed to plans
h. Electrical plan
i. Wall bracing plan



SITE PLAN
**EXAMPLE ONLY**

ADDRESS:

APN: XXX-XX-XXXX

Q.S.: XX-XX

SUBDIVISION:

LOT #: 

ZONING: 

LOT AREA:                8,000 SQ FT

EXISTING:
     

         HOUSE:      2,143.26 SQ FT
       

         GARAGE:       443.29 SQ FT

PROPOSED:
       

         PATIO:            284.05 SQ FT
       

         WALL:                       75 LN FT
       

         ADDITION:   311.58 SQ FT

PLEASE NOTE:

    SITE PLAN MUST MATCH                    
CONFIGURATION FOR YOUR LOT AND 
MUST BE SCALED

    IF PROPOSED WALL IS ON THE     
PROPERTY LINE, MUST PROVIDE 
NEIGHBORING  PROPERTY  OWNER’S 
WRITTEN AUTHORIZATION

    IF PROPOSED WALL IS IN A PUBLIC 
UTILITY EASEMENT, WRITTEN    
AUTHORIZATION IS REQUIRED FROM 
ALL UTILITY COMPANIES

PROVIDE 3 COPIES OF SITE PLAN

Written and bar
SCALE
1” = 20’

Use engineering

20’

N

FEMA BLOCK
Panel

Number
Panel
Date

FIRM
Date

FIRM
ZoneSu�x

Base Flood Elevation
(AO Zone, use depth)

Community
Number

045012

16’ A
LLEY 78 L.F. EXISTING WALL

PROPOSED PATIO COVER

EXISTING
HOUSE

EXISTING
GARAGE

EXISTING
DRIVEWAY

PRO
PERTY LIN

E 100’
65’ N

EW
 W

A
LL - 6’ H

IG
H

12’

12’

10’ NEW
  6’  WALL

PROPOSED
ADDITION

PR
O

PE
RT

Y 
LI

N
E 

10
0’

22’
BSL

22’
BSL

45
 L

.F
. E

XI
ST

IN
G

 W
A

LL

5’
BSL

PROPERTY LINE
80’

20’
BSL

25’

8’
P.U

.E.
25’ 

RO
W

CENTERLINE OF STREET

BACK OF CURB

SIDEWALK

WATER
METER

CL

8’

PROPERTY LINE

5’
BSL

10’

25’

80’



 

Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels      3 

FEMA Block Information 
 

In accordance with FEMA and City requirements, the following  
information must be included on the cover sheet of all plans which  
establish lowest floor elevations and flood-proofing elevations for  

both residential and non-residential structures. 
  
  

FLOOD INSURANCE RATE MAP (FIRM) INFORMATION 
       

Community 
Number 

Panel 
Number 

Panel 
Date Suffix 

FIRM 
Date 

FIRM 
Zone 

Base Flood Elevation (AO Zone, 
use depth) 

045012             
       
              
       
Engineer's Certification: 
  

The lowest floor elevation(s) and/or flood-proofing elevation(s)  
on this plan are sufficiently high to provide protection from flooding caused by a one 
hundred year storm, and are in accordance with City of Scottsdale Revised Code, 
Chapter 37- Floodways & Floodplains Ordinance. 

       
* PLEASE NOTE * 

       
From the Code of Federal Rules- 44CFR 65.2 Certification of data is a statement 
that the data is accurate to the best of the certifier's knowledge.  
       
* Certification analysis is a statement that the analysis have been performed 
correctly and in accordance with sound engineering practices. 
 
 

* Certification of structural works is a statement that the works are designed in 
accordance with sound engineering practices to provide protection from the base flood. 
 

* Certification of "as built" conditions is a statement that the structure(s) has been built according 
to the plans being certified is in place and is fully functioning. 

 
 
 



4      Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels                                                                                                                   

Additional Attachments 
 
a. Water meter calculation sheet to be completed if you are adding any new plumbing fixtures, 

Soils Testing Waiver, and Fire Sprinkler Worksheet. (see page 5) 
b. These examples of typical residential details show you the type of information that we are 

looking for on your plans (see page 8).  Examples include: 

• Foundation Plan Example 
• Floor Plan Example 
• Framing Plan Example 
• Exterior Elevations Example 
• Section A Example 
• Exterior Wall Footing Example 
• Framing Details Connections Example 
• Gable End Bracing Example 
• Typical Wood Frame, Wall Section Example 

 
c. Instructions to incorporate residential notes on the plans as a block.  It will facilitate the review 

of the project. (see page 21)



Single-Family Residential

To determine the water meter fee, the water development fee and the sewer connection fee, we must know the size of the water 
meter required for the residence. To determine the correct size, please provide the following essential information.  

This does NOT permit the violation of any section of any federal, state or local regulations. 

1. Total number of fixture units (FU’s) of all water using outlets is:

Type of Fixture 
FU’s 

Existing 
Fixture 
Count 

New 
Fixture 
Count 

Total 
FU’s 

Bidet 2 X + = 
Bathtub (with/without shower head) 1.4 X + = 
Clothes washer 1.4 X + = 
Dish washer 1.4 X + = 
Full-bath group with bathtub (with or w/o shower head) or shower stall 3.6 X + = 
Half-bath group (water closet & lavatory) 2.6 X + = 
Hose bibb (sillcock) 2.5 X + = 
Kitchen group (dishwasher & sink with/without grinder) 2.5 X + = 
Kitchen sink 1.4 X + = 
Laundry group (clothes washer & laundry tub) 2.5 X + = 
Laundry tub 1.4 X + = 
Lavatory 0.7 X + = 
Shower stall 1.4 X + = 
Water closet (tank type) 2.2 X + = 
*Other X + = 

Total = 
*Water supply outlets for items not listed above shall be computed at their maximum demand, or according to the size of the

supply pipe as indicated in the currently adopted International Plumbing Code; whichever is greater. 

2) Total length of the piping  from the water meter to the farthest water-using outlet/fixture is:  lineal feet. 

3) Local water service pressure is  pounds per square inch (psi). 

4) Total square footage under roof: .** 

**When the TOTAL square footage under roof exceeds 12,000 sq ft, the minimum required meter size shall be not less than 
1-1/2”, and the minimum supply from the meter to the building shall be not less than 2” ID pipe.

It is the owner/builders responsibility to conduct a water pressure test at your site or as near as possible to your site. Your building 
permit cannot be issued until you have obtained this info. An approved type pressure regulator is required to be installed 

Owner/Agent: 

Phone: 

Fax: 

E-mail:

Signature: Date: 

When approved by the City of Scottsdale, the Applicant shall deliver a copy of this form, or the City approved plans, to  the Fire 
Sprinkler Designer to use in the calculation of the fire sprinkler system. Verification of the Meter size must accompany Fire 

Sprinkler plans submitted for review . 

Planning and Development Services
7447 E. INDIAN SCHOOL ROAD   SUITE 100, SCOTTSDALE, AZ   85251-3915   |   www.ScottsdaleAZ.gov 

Plan Check Number: Date: 

To be completed by the Plans Examiner 

Size of Meter 

Size of Building Supply 

Water Meter Sizing Calculations







 

6      Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels                                                                                                                   

Soils Testing Waiver 
You will need to provide a soils testing report or request a soils testing waiver. Use to the following 
form to request a soils testing waiver. 
 

12/95-wmeter2.doc 

=  

 Soils Testing Requirement 
Request for Waiver of Requirement 

This certificate may be used in lieu of providing soils reports for single-family residences. 

This does NOT permit the violation of any section of the Scottsdale Building Code  
or any federal, state or local regulations. 

Project Name:    Plan Check No.:  

Address:    Zip Code:  

To be completed and signed by OWNER before a building permit is issued. 

I,                                                                             (owner name – please print), hereby request 
waiver of the requirement that the City of Scottsdale be provided with a soil test report 
specifying bearing soil capacities and classifications of soil for my prospective building lot / 
site. 
  
 
I hereby certify the following: 
  
All footings, including isolated column footings shall be located with their bearing at 
eighteen inches (18”) minimum below lowest adjacent undisturbed soil or engineer certified 
compacted grade within 5’-0” and shall be: 
  

a.) Provided with a minimum effective soil bearing capacity of one thousand five 
hundred pounds per square foot (1500 psf). 

b.) Designed for a maximum effective bearing pressure of one thousand five hundred 
pounds per square foot (1500 psf). 

   
 
Furthermore, the City of Scottsdale, Arizona, will be held harmless for any damage resulting 
from insufficient bearing pressure, expansive soil or any other soil problems. 

 
 

    
Owners Signature  Date   

If submitted by owner’s agent, list title and relationship to project and furnish a letter signed by owner authorizing you as agent. 

Planning & Development Services Department 
7447 E Indian School Road, Suite 125, Scottsdale, AZ  85251  Phone: 480-312-7080  Fax:  480-312-7781 

For an online version, go to www.scottsdaleaz.gov/bldgresources/forms.  

http://www.scottsdaleaz.gov/bldgresources/forms


USE SQ. FT. VALUE VALUATION*

LIVABLE / CONDITIONED AREA X 118.45 =
BASEMENT - UNFINISHED X 47.80 =

=
GARAGE X 47.80 =
CARPORT X 47.80 =
COVERED PATIO X 47.80 =

=

C TOTAL EXISTING VALUE, (A+B) =

D FACTORED EXISTING VALUE X 25% =

LIVABLE / CONDITIONED AREA X 118.45 =
BASEMENT - UNFINISHED X 47.80 =

=
GARAGE X 47.80 =
CARPORT X 47.80 =
COVERED PATIO X 47.80 =

=

LIVABLE / CONDITIONED AREA X 118.45 X 30% =
GARAGE X 47.80 X 30% =
CARPORT X 47.80 X 30% =
COVERED PATIO X 47.80 X 30% =
BASEMENT - UNFINISHED X 47.80 X 30% =

=

H TOTAL NEW AND REMODEL, (E+F+G) =

Job Address:  

The scope of work and related square footages provided are subject to field verification.  Where discrepancies are 
encountered by the inspector, work shall stop and a new worksheet shall be completed, inclusive of the entire known 

scope of work.  Sprinklers shall be installed if indicated on the revised worksheet.     

IF TOTAL H >50% of TOTAL C

 Revised 06/07/2018.* Values per https://cdn-web.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/BVD-0218.pdf

TOTAL A

TOTAL G

TOTAL H

REMODELED AREAS, includes work requiring permit per  IRC 105.2 amended.

TOTAL E

TOTAL F

SINGLE FAMILY VALUATION/

IF H >D FIRE SPRINKLERS WILL BE REQUIRED

A

B

E

F

G

FIRE SPRINKLER WORKSHEET 2001.1

TOTAL B

TOTAL C

TOTAL D
NEW CONSTRUCTION/ADDITION 

EXISTING NON-SPRINKLED BUILDING



 

 8      Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels                                                                                                                   

Foundation Plan Example 

51'-0"
20'-0"

ANCHOR BOLTS
6' OC MAX.

4" CONCRETE SLAB ON
4" ABC
LOWEST FLOOR TO MATCH
EXISTING LIVABLE

EX
IS

TI
N

G 
H

O
U

SE
12

'-
0"

EXISTING HOUSE

CARPORT

A B

 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

                                                                                              Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels      9  

Floor Plan Example 

20'-0"

NEW ADDITION

SD SD

SD

SD

SD = SMOKE DETECTOR

EX
IS

TI
N

G 
H

O
U

SE
12

'-
0"

EXISTING HOUSE

CARPORT

(2) 4040 SH

4040 SH

4040 SH

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

 10      Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels                                                                                                                   

Framing Plan Example 
 

2x8  16" OC

5 1/8“x12” GLB

(2) 2x6  HEADER
             TYPICAL

EXISTING

EX
IS

TI
N

G 
H

O
U

SE
12

'-
0"

EXISTING HOUSE

CARPORT

DETAIL
CONNECTION

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

                                                                                              Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels      11  

Exterior Elevations Example 
 

EXISTING HOUSE

PROVIDE MIN. 2 ELEVATIONS
SHOW EXTERIOR WALL FINISHES
SHOW PITCH OF ROOF

INDICATE ROOFING MATERIAL

SHOW LOCATION OF BRACING PANELS

PROVIDE DIMENSIONS TO HIGHEST RIDGE
SHOW LOCATION OF ALL OPENINGS

4

12

ADDITION

PANEL
BRACING

BRACING
PANEL

BRACING
PANEL

 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

 12      Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels                                                                                                                   

Section A Example 

2 
X

 8
 J

oi
st

s 
(C

ol
la

r 
Ti

es
) @

 2
4”

 O
.C

.

N
ot

e:
S

pa
ce

ab
ov

e
th

e
at

ti
c

is
no

t 
to

be
 u

se
d 

fo
r

st
or

ag
e.

R
ol

le
d

R
oo

fin
g

1/
2”

C
O

X
 o

rO
S

B
30

#
FE

LT

A D
2

A D
2

A D
2

A D
2

2
x

4
o

r
2

x
6

S
tu

d
W

al
l

S
tu

d
s

sp
ac

e
d

@
16

”
O

.C
.E

x
te

ri
or

-
T

1
-1

1
or

S
tu

cc
o

S
ys

te
m

.

12
4

A
ll 

wo
od

 m
at

er
ia

l s
ha

ll
be

 m
in

. D
.F

. #
2 

or
 b

et
te

r

A
LT

.

12- 0”  
 

 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

 20      Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels                                                                                                                   

Nailing Schedule 
Include the Nailing Schedule in the Final Plans. 
Building Elements # and Type of Fastener Spacing of Fasteners 
Joist to sill or girder, toe nail 3-8d   
Sole plate to joist or blocking, face nail 16d 16 - o.c. 
Top or sole plate to stud, end nail 2-16d   
Stud to sole plate, toe nail 3-8d or 2-16d   
Double studs, face nail 10d 24 – o.c. 
Double top plates, face nail 10d 24 – o.c. 
Sole plate to joist or blocking at braced wall panels 3-16d 16 – 

o.c. 
 

Double top plates, minimum 48-inch offset of  
end joints, face nail in lapped area 

 
8-16d 

  

Blocking between joists or rafters to top plate, toe nail 3-8d   
Rim joist to top plate, toe nail 8d 6 – o.c. 
Top plates, laps at corners and intersections, face nail 2-10d   
Built-up header, two pieces with ½ - spacer  
Edge 

 
16d 

16 – o.c. each 

Ceiling joists to plate, toe nail 3-8d   
Continuous header to stud, toe nail 4-8d   
Ceiling joist, laps over partitions, face nail 3-10d   
Ceiling Joist to parallel rafters, face nail 3-10d   
Rafter to plate, toe nail 2-16d   
1x brace to each stud and plate, face nail 2-8d    
Built-up corner studs 10d 24 – o.c. 
Roof rafters to ridge, valley to hip rafters 
 toe nail 
 face nail 

   
4-16d 
3-16d 

Rafter ties to rafters, face 3-8d   
     
     

Wood  structural panels, subfloor, roof and wall sheathing to framing 
     

    Fastener    edges  intermediate 
 
5/16 – ½   6d common nail (subfloor, wall)  6  12 
    8d common nail (roof)   6  12 
19/32 – 1    8d common nail    6  12 
1 1/8 – 1 ¼   10d common nail or 
    8d deformed nail   6  12 
Celluloisc fiberbd           
Sheathing   1 ½ galv. Roofing nail   3  6 
 
a. All nails are smooth-common, box or deformed shanks except where otherwise stated. 
b. Nails shall be spaced at not more than 6 inches on center at all supports where spans are 48 inches or 

greater 
c. Four-foot-by-8-foot or 4-foot-by-9 foot panels shall be applied vertically. 
 
For an online version of the Nailing Schedule, see www.scottsdaleaz.gov/bldgresources/forms.

http://www.scottsdaleaz.gov/bldgresources/forms


 

                                                                                              Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels      13  

Exterior Wall Footing Example 

1/2"X10" ANCHOR BOLT, 7" MIN. IMBED.
@ 48" O.C. & W/N 12" OF PLATE ENDS

ABBREVIATIONS
PRESS. = PRESSURE TREATED
O.C. = ON CENTER
W/N = WITHIN

MONOLITHIC FOOTING

STEM WALL FOOTINGA
-

B
-

 
 
 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

 14      Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels                                                                                                                   

Framing Details Connections 
 
 

ROOFING FELT PER MFR.

2 X 6 RAFTER

1/2 CDX PLY OR OSB

2 X 8 SOLID
CONTINUOUS RIDGE

BOUNDARY NAILING
8d@6" O.C.

B

A

T1-11 OR

2 X  BLOCKING
@ EACH BAY W/

STUCCO SYSTEM

2X_DOUBLE
TOP PLATES

(3) 16d

2X4 OR 2X6 STUD WALL -
STUDS @ 16" O.C.

OPTIONAL 1/2" GYPSUM BOARD

1/2" CDX PLYWOOD OR OSB
ROOF SHEATHING W/
8d's NAILED
6" O.C. EDGES
12" O.C. FIELD

HURRICANE TIE  H2.5

 H2.5 EVERY OTHER STUD (TOP & BOTTOM)

3 16d TO PLATE

NOTE! SPACE ABOVE
ATTIC IS NOT TO BE
USED FOR STORAGE

1" "BIRD'S MOUTH" CUT

-

-

EAVE CONNECTIONS

RIDGE CONNECTIONS

 
 
 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

                                                                                             Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels      15 

Gable End Bracing Example 
 

2x4 TIE 4'0" OC (2) 16d EACH TRUSSW/

GABLE ENDWALL TRUSS

2x BLOCKING BTWN TRUSSES

2x4 FLAT LOOKOUTS
4' OC-TYP.

(3) 16d AT 2x4 BRACE
TO GABLE END TRUSS

8d 6"OC

(3) 16d AT 2x4 BRACE
TO 2x4 FLAT BRACE

16d @ 6" OC TOENAIL

NOTCH TOP CHORD
WHERE REQ.

(2) 16d NAILS
EA END OF BLK'G

(4) 16d NAILS

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

 16      Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels                                                                                                                   

Typical Wood Frame, Wall Section 

 
 
 

 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

                                                                                             Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels      17 

Beam Connections Example 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

 18      Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels                                                                                                                   

Typical Truss Bearing on Masonry Wall Example 
 

 
 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



 

                                                                                             Counter Plan for Single Family Additions and Remodels      19 

Window Flashing Details Example 
 

Attach sill strip with top edge level with rough
sill; extend beyond edge of rough opening at
least  8".  Secure all building paper or similar
approved flashing material with galvanized
nails or power driven staples.

Attach jamb strips with side edge even
with rough-jamb framing.  Start strip
1" below lower edge of sill strip and
extend 4" above lower edge of lintel.

Install window into rough opening with sill
and jamb flanges over previously installed
flashing.  Attach head flashing over the
window flange.

Commencing at the bottom(sole plate) of the
wall, lay building paper under sill strip.
Cut any excess building paper that may extend
above the sill flange line on each side of
opening (shown as dashed line). Do not cut
building paper horizontally so the paper
will lap over the jamb strips. Install successive
lines of building paper (B,C,D etc) over jamb
and head flanges, lapping each course.

8"
1"

4"

2" min.
overlap

LINTEL

SILL

WINDOW
ROUGH-IN
OPENING

OPENING
ROUGH-IN
WINDOW

LINTEL

Step 1 Step 2

Step 3 Step 4

C

B

A

 
 
 
 
 
Figure is for example purposes only. 



P L A N N I N G  &  D E V E L O P M E N T  S E R V I C E S  D E P A R T M E N T    
 

2 0 21  I N T ER N AT I ON AL R ESI D EN T I AL C OD E 
B u i l d i n g  C o d e  P l an  R ev i ew C h e c k l i s t   

 

P L A N N I N G  &  D E V E L O P M E N T  S E R V I C E S  D E P A R T M E N T  L A S T  M O D I F I E D  2 / 8 / 2 0 2 3  

 
 

CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS MINIMUM DESIGN GUIDELINES 
 
 
IRC TABLE R301.2 

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA 

GROUND 
SNOW 
LOAD 

WIND DESIGN 
SEISMIC 
DESIGN 

CATEGORY 

SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM ICE 
BARRIER 

UNDERLAY-
MENT 

AIR 
FREEZING 

INDEX 

MEAN 
ANNUAL 

TEMP 
Speed 
(mph). 

Topographic 
effects 

Special wind 
region 

Windborne 
debris zone Weathering Frost line 

depth Termite 

0 105 No No No B Negligible Final 
Grade Moderate No 0 71.2° F 

 
MANUAL J DESIGN CRITERIA 

ELEVATION 
ALTITUDE 

CORRECTION 
FACTOR 

COIINCIDENT WET 
BULB 

INDOOR WINTER 
DESIGN DRY-BULB 

TEMPERATURE 

OUTDOOR WINTER 
DESIGN DRY-BULB 

TEMPERATURE 

HEATIMG 
TEMPERATURE 

DIFFERENCE 

1,473 feet 0.97 70°F Maximum of 72°F 37°F 20.6°F 

LATITUDE DAILY RANGE 
INDOOR SUMMER 

DESIGN RELATIVE-
HUMIDITY 

INDOOR SUMMER 
DESIGN DRY-BULB 

TEMPERATURE 

OUTDOOR SUMMER 
DESIGN DRY-BULB 

TEMPERATURE 

COOLING 
TEMPERATURE 

DIFFERENCE 

33.62 N High (H) 45% Minimum of 75°F 105°F 20.1°F 

 

BUILDING CODE DESIGN DATA 
 

All construction within Scottsdale shall comply with the following codes and amendments per their adopting 
ordinances:  
 

2021 International Building Code (ord. # 4550, resolution #12498) 
2021 International Residential Code (ord. # 4575, resolution #12499) 
2021 International Fire Code (ord. # 4562, resolution #12583) 

 
APPLICANT:  Plan submittal shall include the following plans: 
 
 Site Plan 
 Floors 
 Foundation and Roof Plans 
 Elevations and Building Sections (minimum two building sections) 
 Building Details 

 



 

2021 IRC PLAN REVIEW CHECKLIST 
Bui lding Code Plan Review 

2 OF 10 Last Modified 2/8/2023 

 
 

 Plumbing Plan (water supply line sizes, gas supply line sizes, water-heating equipment, hot water recirculation pump 
controls, fixture flow and flush rates) 

 Mechanical Plan (equipment type/size, supply/return, outside air ventilation, exhaust fan systems) 
 Electrical Plan (lighting, power, load calculation, single line diagram) 
 Plans must include a plan index, be readable and to “scale”. 
 Place all required notes on the drawings. 
 Specification books on Single Family Plan checks are not acceptable 
 Provide a True North Arrow and an Orientation North Arrow on site plans and floor plans. 

 
A. Standard Plans  

1. Provide a soils report and a compaction test for the 
subdivision. 

2. Per the soils report provide over-excavation and / or re-
compaction for foundations and slabs on grade. 

3. Note a provision for a continuous three-foot-wide path 
of travel from all bedroom egress windows to a public 
way.  

4. Show minimum allowable dimensions from stem wall to 
property lines on foundation plan.  

5. Remove all parcel/lot specific information from plan set. 
(i.e. site plan). 

6. The cover sheet must have key plans drawn to scale 
indicating each possible combination of footprint options 
with corresponding building ridge lines to ensure 
conformance with varying lot configurations. 

B. Add/ Alt/ Remodels 
1. Provide scope of work. (IBC 107.2 amended) 
2. Provide separate existing and demolition plans. (IBC 

107.2 amended) 
3. Clearly identify throughout, existing vs. new vs. 

remodeled area.  (IBC 107.2 amended) 
4. Complete and return fire sprinkler worksheet. (IFC 903) 
5. Address smoke and CO detectors throughout house 

with additions/alterations/remodels. (R314-315) 

C. Site Plan 
1. Provide a complete site plan, grading and drainage 

where required. Show flow direction arrows, contour 
grades, and top of curb grades (107.5.1 amended) 

2. Provide a complete project address. (R319.1) 
3. Show location of structure(s) with setback dimensions 

on site plan. (IBC 107.2.5 & R302.1). 
4. Show location of all site fences and retaining walls on 

site plan.  Provide lineal footage of fences and retaining 
walls including wall grades. (IBC 107.2.5) 

5. Reference on site plan, structural details for each site 
retaining wall and fence. (TF, T/RW, TW, TR)  
(IBC 107.2.6) 

6. Provide structural calculations for retaining walls. City of 
Scottsdale, Administrative Policy 13-3.  

7. Show sewer tap and water meter locations at street 
with sizes indicated. (P3008.1) 

8. Include lowest floor elevation of livable space. Show 
and identify next upstream manhole rim location and 
elevation, address backwater valve. (P3008.1). 

9. If septic system, provide copy of septic system permit 
application from Maricopa County.  (P2602.1) 

10. When enclosing pool, provide minimum 3-foot wide, 
minimum 60-inch high, out-swinging, self-closing gate. 
(AG105.2 amended) 

D. GREEN BUILDING 
1. Provide a separate plan sheet listing the baseline 13 

"green" building measures and the rating options 
selected from rating checklist.  Include the points 
permitted for each selection and a total summary 
(mandatory measures for baseline level and 20 points 
for advanced level). 

2. Incorporate the "green" building requirements with-in 
the plan design, including notes and details, (i.e. - 
readily accessible return air filter grille; kitchen pull-out 
bins for collection of trash and recycles; etc.). 

3. Provide REScheck, REM/Rate or HERS report for each 
house. 

4. Place the following note in large text on the Floor, 
Foundation, Roof Framing plan sheets: 

 
NOTE: Separate "Green Building" Compliance 
Certificate required prior to Final Inspection. 
 

    E. Floor plans 
a) Doors and Windows 
1. Provide a 1-3/8” solid wood / solid or honeycomb-core 

steel / 20-minute fire-rated self-closing doors between 
residence and garage. (R302.5.1) 

2. Provide permanent landing at exterior doors. (R311.3) 
3. Doors shall not open directly between a sleeping room 

and a garage. (R302.5.1) 



 

2021 IRC PLAN REVIEW CHECKLIST 
Bui lding Code Plan Review 

 
 

 Last Modified 2/8/2023 3 OF 10 

4. Shower doors shall have safety glazing; hinged shower 
doors shall open outward. (R308.4.5 & P2708.1) 

5. Provide and identify all required safety glazing. (R308) 
6. Indicate emergency escape and rescue openings in 

basements and bedrooms. (R310.1) 
7. Show direction of door swing. (R311.3) 
8. Show size of each window and type of operation. 

(R303.1 & 310.2) 
9. Site built windows shall comply with section 2404 of the 

IBC. (R308.5) 
10. Glazing maximum U-factor 0.40, Solar Heat Gain 

Coefficient (SHGC) maximum 0.25 (Table N1102.1.3) 
11. Skylight - maximum U-factor 0.65, SHGC maximum 

0.30.  Provide manufacture and ICC-ES number.  
(Table N1102.1.3) 
 

b) Light and Ventilation 
1. Provide required natural light and ventilation for 

habitable rooms- Light: 8%, ventilation: 4%. (R303.1) 
2. Provide attic ventilation per (R806.1 amended) unless 

insulation is applied on the under-side of roof sheathing. 
or (R806.5)  

3. Enclosed attic or rafter space is not required to be 
ventilated where there is 24 inches or less between the 
bottom of roof sheathing and the ceiling. (R806.1 
amended exception). 

 
c) Stairways, handrails, guardrails 
1. Show handrail, notes, and dimensions. (R311.7.8) 
2. Show guardrails where required. (R312.1) 
3. Provide a floor or landing at the top and bottom of each 

stairway. (R311.7.6) 
4. Provide code complying stairways. Address tread and 

riser dimensions per type of stairway. (R311.7)  
5. Provide stairway illumination per (R303.7 & R303.8) 
6. Stairway maximum 12’-3” vertical rise between 

floor/landing (R311.7.3) 
 
d) Fireplaces and Gas Appliances 
1. Provide manufacturer, model number and ICC report or 

equal for each fireplace. (R1002, R1004 & R1005) 
2. Provide a permanently installed approved decorative 

appliance/gas log set. (R1004.4) 
3. Fireplace dampers: Where a listed decorative appliance 

is installed, the fireplace damper opening shall comply 
with listed decorative appliance manufacture’s 
installation instructions.  (G2453.1) 

4. Decorative shrouds shall not be installed at the 
termination of chimneys of factory-built fireplaces 
except where listed and labeled for such use. 
(R1004.3) 

5. Provide outside combustion air for interior fireplaces. 
(R1006.2). 
 

e) General Floor Plan  
1. Show ceiling heights for all rooms, spaces and 

hallways. (R305) 
2. Show thermal envelope (exterior insulated walls) that 

encloses interior conditioned space. (N1101.5.1) 
3. Show minimum clearances from centerline of water 

closets to finished wall, cabinets, and other plumbing 
fixtures. (R307.1) 

4. Gypsum Board applied to a ceiling shall be 1/2” when 
framing members are 16” o.c. or 5/8” when framing 
members are 24” o.c. or use labeled 1/2” sag-
resistant gypsum ceiling board. (Table R702.3.5) 
 

f) Manufacturers’ Installation Instructions 
1. Manufacture’s installation instructions, as required by 

this code, shall be available on the job site at the time of 
inspection (R106.1.2) 

2. RANGES AND COOKTOPS: Show note on plans. 
Provide a listed and approved range and/or cooktop 
unit installed in accordance with the listing and with 
the manufacturer’s installation instructions.  VERIFY 
AND MAINTAIN REQUIRED HORIZONTAL AND 
VERTICAL CLEARANCES ABOVE THE FINISHED 
COUNTERTOP SURFACE BEFORE ORDERING 
OR INSTALLING CABINETS. 

 
F. Braced/Shear wall Plan 

1. Provide a complete braced/shear wall plan and 
reference a braced /shear wall schedule at each 
braced/shear wall location. (R602.10)  

2. Braced/Shear wall schedule to include anchor bolts, 
holdowns, studs and spacing, sheathing and nailing.  
(R602) 

3. Address “alternate braced wall panels” per (R602.10.6) 
4. Coordinate post locations with holdowns on foundation 

plan. (R602.11) 
5. Show and identify each required holdown on foundation 

plan.  
6. Provide Wood-Stud wall Engineering Analysis for 

bearing walls Over 10 Feet High (T. R602.3 (5)) 

G. Elevation Plan  
1. Provide minimum of four elevation drawings of building: 

typical front, back, left and right.  
2. Show building heights and dimensions.  
3. Show and label all exterior surface building materials. 

(R703) 
4. Show manufacturer, model number and ICC/NER 

Report Number for stucco, roof materials, stone veneer. 
(R703.7) 

5. Provide weather flashing/proofing and exterior wall 
penetrations/openings. (R703.1& 703.2) 



 

2021 IRC PLAN REVIEW CHECKLIST 
Bui lding Code Plan Review 

 
 

 Last Modified 2/8/2023 4 OF 10 

H. Sections  
1. Provide minimum two building cross sections. 
2. Cut cross-sections on foundation, floor and roof framing 

plans.  
3. Show thermal envelope (insulated walls, floors, ceilings, 

roofs) with continuous air barrier around interior 
conditioned space. (N1101.5.1) 

4. Foam plastics shall be separated from the interior of a 
building including attics and crawl spaces by an 
approved thermal barrier. (R316.4) 

5. Show required fire blocking on each section. (R602.8) 
6. Show height dimensions on each cross-section.  
7. Label all rooms, spaces, and hallways on each section.  
8. Provide and reference/key structural details for critical 

connections for cross-sections.  

I. Wall Construction 
1. Provide a cross section detail and wall legend for each 

type of wall.  
2. Callout exterior materials, including, stucco system, 

lath, building paper, foam, and sheathing where 
required. (R703) 

3. Specify on plans, interior wall materials. (R702) 
4. Specify on plans, interior wall construction, coverings, 

and backings for tile and in wet locations. (R702.1) 
5. Provide weepscreed and dimensions from soil and 

paved surfaces. (R703.7.2.1) 
6. Provide nailing schedule. (R602.3) 

J. Foundation Plan  
1. For single-family custom submittal, provide a soils 

report or a soils waiver signed by owner.  
2. Provide a complete fully dimensioned and detailed 

foundation plan. 
3. Address foundation drainage per (R405.1) 
4. Address foundation damp proofing (R406.1) 
5. Show isolated footing dimensions and reinforcing. 

(R403.1 amended) 
6. Show note: Exterior and interior footings shall bear 

minimum 18 inches below undisturbed soil or engineers 
certified compacted fill. (R403.1 amended) 

7. Show required reinforcing steel for all footings and 
stem. (R 403.1.3.5) 

8. Reference a complete set of structural details, footing, 
stem, turndown, pad footing, post at stem, etc. 

9. Clearly show, dimension and detail interior bearing 
footings and shearwall footings.  

10. Clearly show each required post location on foundation 
plan, coordinate with shearwall and roof framing plans.  

11. Clearly show and label each required holdown on 
foundation plan. (R403.1.6) 

12. Show and detail building retaining walls and basement 
and foundation walls, including drainage. (R 405.1)  

13. Provide any/all slab elevations.  

K. Floor and Roof Framing Plans  
1. Provide a complete fully detailed floor and/or roof-

framing plan. (R107.2 amended) 
2. Clearly identify all framing members, including 

posts/columns, headers, beams, joists, and trusses. 
(R107.2 amended). 

3. Clearly show each required post and size, coordinate 
with foundation plan.  

4. Show and identify posts from above framing.  
5. Show floor-to-floor tie, mechanical connectors.  
6. Clearly show and identify all truss/joist hangers.  
7. Cleary show and identify beam to post mechanical 

connectors.  
8. Clearly show and key detail reference(s) for each beam 

to post, beam-to-beam, and girder to beam 
connections.  

9. Detail typical truss/joist to wall, beam, and girder 
connections.  

10. If pre-qualifying conditions are met, deferred 
submittals for truss design drawing may be allowed 
per (R802.10.1.1 amended) 

11. Show lateral full height blocking at braced/shear wall 
line for joists, rafters and trusses.  

12. Framing details shall reflect types of framing members, 
trusses flat and sloped, I-joists, dimension lumber 
rafters, etc. 

13. Show stair mechanical attachment at top and bottom.  
14. Framing members to accommodate masonry fireplace 

clearances to combustibles.  (Table R1001.11) 
15. Provide detail showing how lateral forces are 

transferred from roof diaphragm into shear wall. 
16. Identify all trusses used as drag struts and show loads 

on framing plan.  
17. Framing members to accommodate mechanical 

equipment requirements if installed in attic.  
 
K. Structural Calculations 

 
1. Provide the following structural engineering 

calculations: 
a. Gravity loads analysis. 
b. Lateral loads analysis. 
c. Retaining wall calculations per policy #15-3. 
d. Provide special inspections per (IBC Ch. 17). 

 

M. Building Thermal Envelope 
1. Energy compliance shall be demonstrated by 

prescriptive, UA trade-off (REScheck) or performance 
(REM/Rate, ERI, HERS) compliance path. 



 

2021 IRC PLAN REVIEW CHECKLIST 
Bui lding Code Plan Review 

 
 

 Last Modified 2/8/2023 5 OF 10 

2. Mechanical closets requiring outside combustion air for 
gas furnace or water heater shall be thermally isolated 
from the building unless the equipment is direct-vent. 

3. Recessed luminaires installed in the building thermal 
envelope shall be sealed to limit air leakage between 
conditioned and unconditioned spaces. All recessed 
luminaires shall be IC-rated and labeled as having an 
air leakage rate not more than 2.0 cfm. All recessed 
luminaires shall be sealed with a gasket or caulk 
between the housing and the interior wall or ceiling 
covering. (N1102.4.5). 

4. The building or dwelling unit shall be tested and verified 
as having an air leakage rate of not exceeding 5.0 air 
changes per hour for detached dwelling units.  Testing 
shall be conducted with a blower door at a pressure of 
0.2 inches w.g. (50 Pascal’s).  Testing shall be 
conducted by an approved third party.  A written report 
of the results of the test shall be signed by the party 
conducting the test and provided to the building official. 
Testing shall be performed at any time after creation of 
all penetrations of the building thermal envelope. 
(N1102.4.1.2). 

N. Mechanical Plan 
1. Show mechanical equipment and water heaters on 18-

inch platform if placed in garage or room with direct 
access to garage. (M1307.3). 

2. Provide combustion air and show hi and low vent 
opening sizes for gas fuel appliances located in 
confined spaces. (G2407). 

3. Provide and reference approved detail for gas piping to 
gas island cooktop. (G2415.14). 

4. Provide kitchen exhaust fan vented direct to outside. 
(M1505.2 amended, Table M1505.4.4). 

5. Show mechanical system design criteria, types, sizes, 
efficiencies and controls (N1101.5). 

6. Provide HVAC equipment sizing calculations. Heating 
and cooling equipment shall be sized in accordance 
with ACCA Manual S based on building loads 
calculated in accordance with ACCA Manual J or other 
approved calculation methodologies (N1103.7). 

7. Provide minimum 15 SEER (Seasonal Energy 
Efficiency Ratio) for air conditioning equipment. 

8. Provide minimum 78% AFUE (Annual Fuel Utilization 
Efficiency) for weatherized gas heating equipment, non-
weatherized equipment minimum 80% AFUE. 

9. Each separate heating and cooling system shall be 
provided with at least one programmable thermostat 
(N1103.1). 

10. Show how the building is provided with outside air 
ventilation in accordance with Section M1505. Outdoor 
air intakes and exhausts shall have automatic or gravity 
dampers that close when the ventilation system is not 
operating. (N1103.6). 

11. Provide mechanical exhaust ventilation for 
bathrooms, water closet rooms, laundry room, and 
kitchen, ducted direct to outside. Bathrooms, water 
closet compartments and other similar rooms shall 
be provided with a mechanical ventilation system, 
with a minimum ventilation rate of 50 cfm (23.6 L/s) 
for intermittent ventilation, or 20 cfm (9.4 L/s) for 
continuous ventilation Except where functioning as a 
component of a whole house ventilation system, 
exhaust fans in bathrooms with a shower or tub shall 
be provided with a delay timer or humidity/ 
condensation control sensor. Exhaust fans shall be 
switched separately from lighting systems. 
(Amended R303.3 1 and M1505.) 

12. Duct systems serving heating, cooling and ventilation 
equipment shall be installed in accordance with the 
provisions of this section and ACCA Manual D or other 
approved methods. (M1601.1) 

13. Show supply and return air ducts and registers. 
14. Supply and return ducts in attics shall be insulated to a 

minimum R-8 where 3 inches in diameter or greater.  
Ducts in other portions of the building shall be insulated 
to minimum R-6 where 3 inches in diameter or greater. 
(N1103.3.1) 

15. Ducts, air handlers, and filter boxes shall be sealed in 
accordance with Sections N1103.3.4 and M1601.4.1.  
Ducts shall be pressure tested to determine air leakage 
by one of the following methods (N1103.3.5): 
a) Rough-in test: Total leakage shall be measured 

with a pressure differential of 0.1 inch w.g. (25 
Pa) across the system, including the 
manufacturer’s air handler enclosure if installed 
at the time of the test. All registers shall be 
taped or otherwise sealed during the test. 

b) Post construction test: Total leakage shall be 
measured with a pressure differential of 0.1 inch 
w.g. (25 Pa) across the entire system, including 
the manufacturer’s air handler enclosure. 
Registers shall be taped or otherwise sealed 
during the test. 

A written report of results shall be signed by the party 
conducting the test and provided to the code official. 

16. Building framing cavities shall not be used as ducts or 
plenums (N1103.3.7). 

17. Dwelling units shall be provided with mechanical 
ventilation airflow rates in accordance with Section 
M1505 (N1103.6). 

18. Mechanical ventilation systems shall be tested and 
verified to provide the minimum ventilation flow rates 
required by Section N1103.6. A written report of results 
shall be signed by the party conducting the test and 
provided to the code official (N1103.6.3). 

O. Electrical Plan and Lighting 
1. Provide a complete Electrical Plan 



 

2021 IRC PLAN REVIEW CHECKLIST 
Bui lding Code Plan Review 

 
 

 Last Modified 2/8/2023 6 OF 10 

2. Provide fully noted plan showing, all required 
receptacles, light fixtures, switches, exhaust fans, 
smoke detectors, service panels and sub-panels. 
(E3703 & E3901) 

3. Provide notes and symbols legend.  
4. Show and label all required GFCI and WP/GFCI 

receptacles. (E3902) 
5. Show and label all required AFCI circuits. (E3902.16) 
6. In areas specified in Section E3901.1, 125-volt, 15- and 

20-ampere receptacles shall be listed tamper-resistant 
receptacles. (E4002.14) 

7. Show that all permanently installed lighting fixtures 
contain only high-efficacy lamps (N1104.1) 

8. Show that permanently installed interior lighting fixtures 
are controlled with either a dimmer, an occupant sensor 
control or other control such as an automatic timer shut-
off switch. Exceptions include bathrooms and hallways. 
(N1104.2) 

9. Show that exterior lighting over 30 watts include 
automatic shut-off. (N1104.3) 

10. Show and label all WP/DP lighting fixtures as 
SUITABLE FOR WET OR DAMP LOCATIONS 
accordingly. (E4001.7) 

11. Show and label all smoke alarms. Smoke alarms shall 
be installed in the following locations:  
1) In each sleeping room.  
2) Outside each separate sleeping area in the 
immediate vicinity of the bedrooms.  
3) On each additional story of the dwelling, including 
basements and habitable attics but not including crawl 
spaces and uninhabitable attics. In dwellings or dwelling 
units with split levels and without an intervening door 
between the adjacent levels, a smoke alarm installed 
on the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower 
level provided that the lower level is less than one full 
story below the upper level.  
4) Smoke alarms shall be installed not less than 3 feet 
horizontally from the door or opening of a bathroom that 
contains a bathtub or shower unless this would prevent 
placement of a smoke alarm required by Section 
R314.3. 
5) In dwelling units where the ceiling height of a room 
open to the hallway serving the bedrooms exceeds that 
of the hallway by 24 inches or more, smoke alarms 
shall be installed in the hallway and in the adjacent 
room. (R314.3 amended). 
6) smoke alarms devices shall be interconnected 
unless listed wireless alarms are installed (R314.4) and 
shall receive their primary power from the building 
wiring (R314.6). 
Show and label all carbon monoxide alarms, an 
approved carbon monoxide alarm shall be installed 
outside of each separate sleeping area in the 
immediate vicinity of the bedrooms in dwelling units 
within which fuel-fired appliances are installed and in 
dwelling units that have attached garages. (R315), 

carbon alarms devices shall be interconnected unless 
unless listed wireless alarms are installed (R315.5) and 
shall receive their primary power from the building 
wiring (R315.6). 

12. Provide a UFER ground encased in concrete footing. 
(E3608.1.2) 

13. The main electrical service panel shall have a reserved 
space to allow installation of a dual pole circuit breaker 
for “future solar electric” installation and shall be labeled 
as such (U103.7). 

14. For Electrical Services greater than 400 amps, 
PROVIDE ELECTRICAL LOAD CALCULATIONS.   

15. Provide an ELECTRICAL SINGLE LINE DIAGRAM for 
Services 200 amps and larger. 

P. Plumbing Plan  
1. Provide a single line gas-piping diagram; include all gas 

burning appliances and BTUs of each appliance, show 
pipe lengths and sizes from gas meter to each branch 
line and to each appliance. (G2413) 

2. Show type of gas piping. (G2414) 
3. Do not place gas piping under slab. (G2415.14) 
4. Provide approved detail for gas piping to kitchen island 

gas cook top. (G2415.14) 
5. Show all drainage/sewer piping materials. (Tables 

P3002.1, P3002.2) 
6. Show high efficiency plumbing fixtures that meet the 

following maximum flow and flush rates:  Lavatory 
faucets: 1.5 gal/minute; Shower heads: 2.0 gal/minute; 
Kitchen faucet: 1.8 gal/minute; water closets: 1.28 
gal/flush. (Table P2903.2. amended). 

7. Provide roof drains and over-flow/scuppers. (R903.4). 
8. Show mechanical and service water heating system 

types, sizes, efficiencies, and controls (N1101.5). 
9. Storage-tank type water heaters shall be installed with a 

drain pan and drain line. (P2801.6)   
10. WH-pan drain-line shall terminate per (P2801.6.2) 
11. Show minimum R-3 insulation for hot water pipes. 

(N1103.5.2). 
12. A hot water circulation system shall be provided when 

the length of hot water piping or tubing from the source 
of hot water to the furthest fixture exceeds: 21 feet for a 
3/4-inch line, 32 feet for a 5/8 inch line, 43 feet for a 1/2 
inch line and 50 feet for a 3/8 inch line or less 
(N1103.5.1.1.1 amended). 
a) Where the water piping or tubing length contains 

more than one size of pipe, the largest size shall be 
used for determining the maximum allowable 
length of pipe before a circulating hot water system 
is required. For the purposes of this section, the 
source of hot water shall be a water heater, boiler, 
circulation loop piping, distribution manifold, or 
heat-traced piping. 

b) The hot water circulation system shall use a 
dedicated return line or the cold-water supply line 



 

2021 IRC PLAN REVIEW CHECKLIST 
Bui lding Code Plan Review 

 
 

 Last Modified 2/8/2023 7 OF 10 

as the return at the most remote fixture. Gravity and 
thermo-syphon circulation systems shall be 
prohibited. Controls shall start the pump upon 
receiving a signal from the action of a user of a 
fixture or appliance or sensing the flow of hot or 
tempered water to a fixture, fitting or appliance. The 
controls shall automatically turn off the pump when 
the water in the circulation loop is at the desired 
temperature and when there is no demand for hot 
water. 

Q. Fire Sprinklers 
1. Provide fire sprinklers per (IFC 903.). 

R. Additional Energy Requirements 

1. For low-slope roofs (less than 2 in 12 slope), provide a 
light-colored roof surface with a minimum solar 
reflectance index (SRI) of 64. (New N1102.6) 

2. Reserve electrical service panel space for full-size 2-
pole circuit breaker labeled “Future EV Charging” with 
electrical raceway installed from panel to a junction box 
in the garage labeled “Future EV Charging”. (New 
N1104.4) 

3. Identify a solar-ready zone not less than 10% of the 
total roof area over conditioned space but not less than 
300 square feet exclusive of access and set back areas 
as required by the International Fire Code. The zone 
shall be free from obstructions, including but not limited 
to vents, chimneys, and roof-mounted equipment.  
Provide electrical pathway for conduit run from electrical 
service panel with reserved space for 2-pole circuit 
breaker. (Appendix AT103 amended) 

4. A permanent energy certificate shall be completed by 
the builder or other approved party and posted in 
accordance with N1101.14 and AT103.10. 

 



 

2021 IRC PLAN REVIEW CHECKLIST 
Bui lding Code Plan Review 

 
 

 Last Modified 2/8/2023 8 OF 10 

 
PLACE THE FOLLOWING NOTES ON DRAWINGS 
If these notes are reproduced on the plans as a block, it will facilitate the review of the project. The notes are available 
and can be downloaded from: City of Scottsdale - Building Review Detail Drawings (scottsdaleaz.gov) Notes 1-13 reflect 2021 
code updates. 

 
2021 International Building Code (ord. # 4550, resolution #12498) 
2021 International Residential Code (ord. # 4575, resolution #12499) 
2021 International Fire Code (ord. # 4562, resolution #12583) 

1. Doors and windows that provide access to the swimming pool/spa, shall be separated by an approved barrier. 
2. *Plumbing fixtures shall comply with the following conservation requirements: Lavatory faucets: 1.5 gal/minute; Shower 

heads: 2.0 gal/minute; Kitchen faucet: 1.8 gal/minute; water closets: 1.28 gal/flush. (Table P2903.2. amended). 
3. *A demand-controlled hot water circulation system shall be provided in accordance with amended Section 

N1103.5.1.1 amended. 
4. *Cool/light reflective coated roofs. Roof solar reflectance and thermal emittance for roof slopes less than 2:12. Three-

year-aged solar reflectance index (SRI) of 64, Three-year-aged solar reflectance of 0.55 and a three-year aged thermal 
emittance of 0.75 over conditioned and non-conditioned spaces. N1102.6 amended. 

5. *The building thermal envelope shall comply with climate zone 2. Energy compliance shall be demonstrated by UA 
trade-off (REScheck) OR performance (REM/Rate, ERI, HERS) compliance path OR by the following prescriptive values 
(Table N1102.1.3):  Prescriptive minimum R-values: (*Ceiling=R-49) / (Walls=R-13).  

6. Prescriptive maximum Window Fenestration values: (U-Factor=0.40) / (SHGC=0.25).  
7. *Exterior lighting over 30 watts shall include an automatic shut-off. (N1104.3). 
8. *All permanently installed lighting fixtures shall contain only high-efficacy lamps. (N1104.1). 
9. *All permanently installed interior lighting fixtures shall be controlled with either a dimmer, an occupant sensor 

control or other control such as an automatic timer shut-off switch. Exceptions include bathrooms and hallways. 
(N1104.2). 

10. *E3606.5 Surge protection. All electrical services supplying one- and two-family dwelling units shall be provided 
with a surge protective device (SPD) installed in accordance with Sections E3606.5.1 through E3606.5.3. 

11. *Electric Vehicle Charging Capacity. Reserve electrical service panel space for a full size 2-pole circuit breaker 
labeled “Future EV Charging”.  A raceway shall be installed from the electrical service panel to a location within 
the garage, where it shall terminate in a junction box or outlet and be labeled “Future EV Charging”. 

12. *Solar-Ready Zones – RB103. Minimum 10% of roof area but not less than 300 sq. ft. free and clear of 
obstructions including mechanical equipment and vents.  Provide electrical pathway for conduit run from solar-
ready zone to electrical service panel with reserved space for 2-pole circuit breaker.  Capped roof penetration 
sleeve shall be provided on roofs with a low-slope of 1 in 12 or less. 

13. *The following three notes are applicable to New Construction only (BPI certified professionals are approved 
for testing air leakage in existing buildings, otherwise RESNET professionals are approved for new and existing): 

a. *The building shall be provided with a whole-house mechanical ventilation system that meets the requirements of 
Section M1505. Outdoor air intakes and exhausts shall have automatic or gravity dampers that close when the 
ventilation system is not operating. (N1103.6). 

b. *The building or dwelling unit shall be tested and verified as having an air leakage rate not exceeding five air 
changes per hour for detached dwelling units and seven air changes per hour for attached dwelling units. Testing 
shall be conducted in accordance with ASTM E 779 or ASTM E 1827 and reported at a pressure of 0.2 inch w.g. 
(50 Pascals). Testing shall be conducted by an approved third party (RESNET certified). A written report of the 
results of the test shall be signed by the party conducting the test and provided to the code official. Testing shall 
be performed at any time after creation of all penetrations of the building thermal envelope. (N1102.4.1.2). 

https://www.scottsdaleaz.gov/design/design-details


 

2021 IRC PLAN REVIEW CHECKLIST 
Bui lding Code Plan Review 

 
 

 Last Modified 2/8/2023 9 OF 10 

c. *Ducts, air handlers, and filter boxes shall be sealed in accordance with N1103.3.4. Joints and seams shall 
comply with Section M1601.4.1. Ducts shall be pressure tested to determine leakage by one of the following 
methods (N1103.3.5): 

1. Rough-in test: Total leakage shall be measured with a pressure differential of 0.1 inches w.g. (25 Pa) 
across the system, including the manufacturer’s air handler enclosure if installed at the time of the test. 
All registers shall be taped or otherwise sealed during the test. 

2. Post-construction test: Total leakage shall be measured with a pressure differential of 0.1 inches w.g. 
(25 Pa) across the system, including the manufacturer’s air handler enclosure. Registers shall be taped 
or otherwise sealed during the test. 

A written report of the results shall be signed by the party conducting the test and provided to the code 
official prior to the Final Building Inspection. 

14. All products listed by an Evaluation Service Report (ESR) shall be installed per the report and the manufactures 
written instructions.  Product substitutions shall also be listed by an ESR. 

15. Provide Fire Sprinkler System per Scottsdale Fire Code (IRC R313 amended). 
16. Separate permits required: pools, spas, fences, site walls, retaining walls, and gas storage tanks. 
17. Foundation & Footing depth shall be a minimum of 18 inches below grade (or per property soil report), provide a 

minimum of 3-inch clearance between Rebar and soil. (R403.1 amended). 
18. Doors between the garage and residence shall be self-closing minimum 1 3/8” thick solid core or 20-minute fire 

rated. (R302.5.1). 
19. Wood sill plates shall be pressure treated or decay resistant.  Exterior sill plates shall bear a minimum of 6 inches 

above finish grade. (R317.1). 
20. Gypsum board applied to a ceiling shall be 1/2” when framing members are 16” o.c. or 5/8” when framing 

members are 24” o.c. or use labeled 1/2” sag-resistant gypsum ceiling board. (Table R702.3.5 (d)). 
21. Showers and tub-shower combinations shall be provided with individual control valves of the pressure balance or 

thermostatic mixing valve type. (P2708.4). 
22. Shower area walls shall be finished with a smooth, hard non-absorbent surface, such as ceramic tile, to a height 

of not less than 72 inches above the drain inlet. Cement, fiber-cement or glass mat gypsum backers installed in 
accordance with manufacturers’ recommendations shall be used as backers for wall tile in tub and shower areas 
and wall panels in shower areas. (R702.4.2). 

23. Storage-tank type water heaters shall be installed with a drain pan and drain line. (P2801.6). 
24. Provide roof/attic ventilation unless insulation is applied directly to underside of the roof-sheathing, or the depth is 

24 inches or less between the ceiling and bottom of roof sheathing. (R806.1 Amended). 
25. Provide Minimum R-3 insulation on hot water pipes. (N1103.5.2). 
26. Supply and return ducts located outside conditioned space shall be insulated to a minimum R-8. Ducts and air 

handlers located completely within the continuous air barrier and within the building thermal envelope are exempt 
from insulation. (N1103.3.1 and N1103.3.2). 

27. Exhaust air from kitchens, bathrooms and toilet rooms shall be exhausted directly to the outdoors, not 
recirculated, or discharged indoors. (M1505.4.4 amended). 

28. Exhaust fans in bathrooms with a shower or tub shall be provided with a delay timer or humidity/condensation 
control sensor. Exhaust fans shall be switched separately from lighting systems. (R303.3). 

29. Provide a wall mounted GFCI protected receptacle outlet within 36” of a bathroom or powder room lavatory. 
(E3901.6). 

30. Receptacles serving kitchen countertops installed in bathrooms, garages, unfinished accessory buildings, 
outdoors and located within 6 feet of sinks shall have GFCI protection for personnel. (E3902). 

31. All branch circuits that supply 15- and 20-ampere outlets installed in kitchens, family rooms, dining rooms, living 
rooms, parlors, libraries, dens, bedrooms, sunrooms, recreations rooms, closets, hallways, laundry areas and 
similar rooms or areas shall be protected by a combination type arc-fault circuit interrupter (AFCI) installed to 
provide protection of the branch circuit. (E3902.12). 

32. General purpose 15- and 20-ampere receptacles shall be listed tamper-resistant. (E4002.14). 



 

2021 IRC PLAN REVIEW CHECKLIST 
Bui lding Code Plan Review 

 
 

 Last Modified 2/8/2023 10 OF 10 

33. Provide interconnected and hardwired Smoke Alarms in new and existing areas of home. (R314). 
34.  Approved Carbon Monoxide Alarms, hardwired and interconnected, shall be installed outside of each separate 

sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms in dwelling units within which fuel-fired appliances are 
installed and in dwelling units that have attached garages. (R315).  

35. Recessed luminaires installed in the building thermal envelope shall be IC-rated and labeled as having an air 
leakage rate not more than 2.0 cfm. All recessed luminaires shall be sealed with a gasket or caulk between the 
housing and the interior wall or ceiling covering. (N1102.4.5). 

36. Provide illumination with wall switches for stairways when there are 6 or more risers. (R303.7). 
37. Receptacle outlets shall be installed so that no point along the floor line in any wall space is more than 6 feet, 

measured horizontally, from an outlet in that space, including any wall space 2 feet or more in width. (E3901.2). 
38. Provide a minimum of two 20-amp small appliance branch circuits for the kitchen/dining/breakfast. (E3703.2). 
39. Provide outside combustion air to all indoor fireplaces per manufactures specifications. (R1006.1). 
40. At least one thermostat shall be provided for each separate heating and cooling system. (N1103.1). 

 


	Minor Remodels/Additions
	Counter Plan Review/Permit Requirements
	Application for Permitting
	General Information 
	Plan Submittal Requirements 
	Site Plan
	FEMA Block Informaiton

	Additional Attachments 
	Water Meter Calculation
	Soils Testing Requirement 
	Fire Sprinkler Worksheet
	Examples (Drawings)
	Foundation Plan Example 
	Floor Plan Example 
	Framing Plan Example 
	Exterior Elevations Example 
	Section A Example 
	Exterior Wall Footing Example 
	Framing Details Connections 
	Gable End Bracing Example 
	Typical Wood Frame, Wall Section 
	Beam Connections Example 
	Typical Truss Bearing on Masonry Wall Example 
	Window Flashing Details Example 

	Nailing Schedule 


	2015 IRC CHECKLIST
	2018 Fire Sprinkler Worksheet - SFR.pdf
	WRKSHT


	PROJECT ADDRESS: 
	Lot: 
	Subdivision: 
	Zoning District: 
	Parcel Number: 
	Quarter Section: 
	Flood Zone: 
	Lot Area: 
	NAOS Sq Footage: 
	PROJECT NAME: 
	Associated PlanCase Numbers: 
	undefined: 
	If Applicable: 
	Check Box1: Off
	Check Box2: Off
	Check Box3: Off
	Check Box4: Off
	Green Building Case: 
	New SFR: Off
	Remodel: Off
	Addition: Off
	New SFR Standard: Off
	Guest House: Off
	New FenceW all: Off
	Retaining W all: Off
	Accessory Structure: Off
	Mechanical: Off
	Plumbing: Off
	Electrical: Off
	Building: Off
	Combo: Off
	Scope of work: 
	Occupied AC: 
	Non Occupied AC  Non AC area under roof: 
	Fence LF: 
	Retaining Wall LF: 
	Occupied AC_2: 
	Non Occupied AC  Non AC area under roof_2: 
	Occupied AC_3: 
	Non Occupied AC  Non AC area under roof_3: 
	Occupied AC_4: 
	Non Occupied AC  Non AC area under roof_4: 
	Property Owner: 
	Contractor: 
	Address: 
	Address_2: 
	City: 
	State: 
	Zip: 
	City_2: 
	State_2: 
	Zip_2: 
	Phone_2: 
	Fax_2: 
	Email_2: 
	ROC: 
	COS Tax License: 
	Architect: 
	Civil Engineer: 
	Company: 
	Company_2: 
	Address_3: 
	Address_4: 
	City_3: 
	State_3: 
	Zip_3: 
	City_4: 
	State_4: 
	Zip_4: 
	Phone_3: 
	Fax_3: 
	Phone_4: 
	Fax_4: 
	Email_4: 
	Email_3: 
	Applicant Contact: 
	Email_5: 
	Company_3: 
	Phone_5: 
	Fax_5: 
	Address_5: 
	City_5: 
	State_5: 
	Zip_5: 
	Others authorized to pick up plans  permits: 
	Applicant Signature: 
	Plan Check Number: 
	Date: 
	Existing Fixture CountX: 
	New Fixture Count_2: 
	Total FUs: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_2: 
	New Fixture Count_3: 
	Total FUs_2: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_3: 
	New Fixture Count_4: 
	Total FUs_3: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_4: 
	New Fixture Count_5: 
	Total FUs_4: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_5: 
	New Fixture Count_6: 
	Total FUs_5: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_6: 
	New Fixture Count_7: 
	Total FUs_6: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_7: 
	New Fixture Count_8: 
	Total FUs_7: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_8: 
	New Fixture Count_9: 
	Total FUs_8: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_9: 
	New Fixture Count_10: 
	Total FUs_9: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_10: 
	New Fixture Count_11: 
	Total FUs_10: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_11: 
	New Fixture Count_12: 
	Total FUs_11: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_12: 
	New Fixture Count_13: 
	Total FUs_12: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_13: 
	New Fixture Count_14: 
	Total FUs_13: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_14: 
	New Fixture Count_15: 
	Total FUs_14: 
	22Other: 
	Existing Fixture CountX_15: 
	New Fixture Count_16: 
	Total FUs_15: 
	Total FUs_16: 
	Total length of the piping from the water meter to the farthest waterusing outletfixture is: 
	Local water service pressure is: 
	Total square footage under roof: 
	OwnerAgent: 
	Phone: 
	Size of Meter: 
	Fax: 
	Size of Building Supply: 
	Email: 
	Date_2: 


